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The textbook introduces the students to the science and technology of powder metallurgy including the
treatment of ceramic powders and powders of some intermetallic compounds. With improved organization
and enriched contents, the book explores a thorough coverage of various aspects of powder metallurgy
involving raw materials, various methods of production of metallic powders and non-metallic powders, their
characteristics, technological aspects of compacting and sintering, various applications of powder metallurgy
technology using different techniques as well as most of the recent developments in powder metallurgy.
With all the latest information incorporated and several key pedagogical attributes included, this textbook is
an invaluable learning tool for the undergraduate students of metallurgical and materials engineering for a
one semester course on powder metallurgy. It also caters to the students of mechanical engineering,
automobile engineering, aerospace engineering, industrial and production engineering for their courses in
manufacturing technology, processes and practices. HIGHLIGHTS OF SECOND EDITION* Sections
exploring the grinding in mills, disintegration of liquid metals and alloys, some more methods for the
production of iron powder by reduction of oxides, metallothermic reduction of oxides, etc. have been
included. * Sections on mechanical comminution of solid materials, structural P/M parts, etc. have been
modified highlighting an up to date version. * Several types of questions have been incorporated in the
additional questions given at the end of book to guide the students from examination and practice point of
view.
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From reader reviews:

Keith Devine:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they get because their hobby will be reading a book. What about the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem
or exercise. Well, probably you will require this Powder Metallurgy: An Advanced Technique of Processing
Engineering Materials.

Michael Palmateer:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept Powder
Metallurgy: An Advanced Technique of Processing Engineering Materials suitable to you? Often the book
was written by popular writer in this era. The book untitled Powder Metallurgy: An Advanced Technique of
Processing Engineering Materialsis a single of several books that will everyone read now. This kind of book
was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new shape that
you ever know prior to. The author explained their plan in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to
understand the core of this reserve. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. In
order to see the represented of the world within this book.

Mary Stone:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This kind of Powder Metallurgy: An Advanced
Technique of Processing Engineering Materials can give you a lot of buddies because by you taking a look at
this one book you have point that they don't and make anyone more like an interesting person. That book can
be one of a step for you to get success. This book offer you information that probably your friend doesn't
understand, by knowing more than other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? We need to have
Powder Metallurgy: An Advanced Technique of Processing Engineering Materials.

Arthur Fabry:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year had been
exactly added. This publication Powder Metallurgy: An Advanced Technique of Processing Engineering
Materials was filled concerning science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific
research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how
big selling point of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like currently, many
ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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