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We want to believe our schools are safe, but how safe are they?Especially in light of the recent, tragic
shootings in towns like Springfield, OR, Conyers, GA and Littleton, CO, parents are running scared.Each
year in schools across the United States, more than 3 million crimes are committed, over 9,000 fires break
out, and hundreds of thousands of students are injured. Administrators are overwhelmed, underfunded, and
sometimes unresponsive.It's time to revisit what we can do to combat a rash of violence, and make schools
safer in general - from the bus to the playground, the lunchroom to the science lab.Safe at School gives you
the knowledge and skills you need to take action, be heard and get results.It covers every school safety
problem you can think of - guns, drugs, supervision, disaster preparation, sexual harassment, asbestos in the
air, lead in the water, bullies, class trips, school maintenance, and many more.Step-by-step actions plans
explain how to identify safety problems at your child's school, how to form a parent safety group (there's
strength in numbers), and how to hold schools accountable for your child's safety.Safe at School is the best
kind of bedside reading - the kind that makes you sleep more soundly at night knowing you're taking steps to
ensure the safety of your child.
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From reader reviews:

Carol Reck:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information today can get by anyone in everywhere. The
information can be a knowledge or any news even restricted. What people must be consider while those
information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously which one
is acceptable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then you
get it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen within you if you take Safe at School: Awareness and Action for Parents as your daily resource
information.

Willie Randolph:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get lot of stress
from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely sure.
People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity have you got when the
spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you ever try
this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is actually Safe at School: Awareness and Action for Parents.

Gerald Wright:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to pick book like comic,
limited story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not seeking Safe at School: Awareness and
Action for Parents that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book.
Reading habit all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world a great deal better then
how they react toward the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading routine only for the geeky
individual but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for every you who want to start
reading as your good habit, you may pick Safe at School: Awareness and Action for Parents become your
own starter.

David McKenney:

That book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Safe at School: Awareness and Action for Parents
was multi-colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Safe at School:
Awareness and Action for Parents has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until teenagers. For example
Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. So , not at
all of book are make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for
you and try to like reading in which.
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